STREETS PRESERVATION CONTRACT STR21 Bid No. 2530

LOCATION: TRAFFIC MANAGEMENT CENTER, 880 WARREN C COLEMAN BLVD CONCORD, NC TIME: 2:00 P.M. **DATE:** April 22, 2021

	Contractor	Blythe Construction Inc.		Ferebee Corporation		J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc.		Blythe Brothers Asphalt Co. LLC															
N.C. License No. Address City, State Zip				7639 PO Box 31635 Charlotte, NC 28231		18306 PO Box 480066 Charlotte, NC 28269		2767 PO Box 670 Albermarle, NC 28002		42840 1415 E Westinghouse Blvd Charlotte, NC 28273													
												Na	5% Bid Bond Included	TT '4	0 11	II '4 D '	Yes	II ', D '	Yes	II ', D '	Yes		es T. T. 1
												No.	Item Crack and Joint Sealing	Units	Quantity	Unit Price	Item Total						
1.1	Seal Existing pavement cracks and joints	lbs	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID												
					NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID												
	Patching, Leveling, Asphalt Seal Coating																						
	Asphalt Full Depth Finished Patching - Place and compact Intermediate Course 3" 119.0B with 2" Surface Course S9.5 B Cap			\$134.00	\$670,000.00	\$138.00	\$690,000.00	\$135.00	\$675,000.00	\$134.00													
2.1	(areas to be determined)	Tons	5,000		,	,	, ,		,		\$670,000.00												
2.2	Asphalt Full Depth Patching - Place and compact Intermediate Course I19.0B (no Surface Course Cap)	Tons	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID												
2.3	Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact Intermediate Course I19.0B	Tons	6,540	\$90.90	\$594,486.00	\$95.00	\$621,300.00	\$104.00	\$680,160.00	\$104.00	\$680,160.00												
2.4	Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact Asphalt Open Graded Leveling Course (P78 or mix as approved by Director)	Tons	2,125	\$98.50	\$209,312.50	\$97.50	\$207,187.50	\$100.00	\$212,500.00	\$109.00	\$231,625.00												
	Place and compact suitable Sub-base material (Location to be				\$8,750.00		\$3,000.00																
2.5	determined) Asphalt Seal Coat	Cu. Yd Sg. Yd	50	\$175.00	NO BID	\$60.00	NO BID	\$100.00	\$5,000.00 NO BID	\$100.00	\$5,000.00 NO BID												
2.0	Aspirati Scar Coat	5q. 1 u	0	<del>-</del>	\$1,482,548.50	-	\$1,521,487.50	-	\$1,572,660.00		\$1,586,785.0												
	Milling				\$1,10 <b>2</b> ,610160		\$1,021,107.00		\$1,072,00000		\$1,000,70010												
3.1	Full Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0" to 4"	Sq. Yd	40,645	\$2.54	\$103,238.30	\$2.50	\$101,612.50	\$3.00	\$121,935.00	\$2.50	\$101,612.50												
3.2	Edge Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0" to 4"	Sq. Yd		\$2.58	\$105,122.10	\$2.75	\$112,048.75	\$3.50	\$142,607.50	\$2.60	\$105,937.00												
3.3	Incidental Milling 0" to 6"	Sq. Yd	400	\$10.10	\$4,040.00	\$20.00	\$8,000.00	\$17.00	\$6,800.00	\$12.00	\$4,800.00												
	Reclamation				\$212,400.40		\$221,661.25		\$271,342.50		\$212,349.50												
4.1	Reclamation of existing roadway with concrete stabilization	Sq. Yd	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID												
	Undercut and replace with approved suitable material for subgrade																						
4.2	repairs	Tons	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID												
	Resurfacing				MO DID		11O DID		HO DID		עום טוו												
	Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course	T.		<b>#</b> 105	0501055	010=	#01 <b>=</b> :	<b>#</b> 105	0.770 533	0.00	#C 10 = :												
5.1	S9.5B Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.5" of Surface Course	Tons	7,785	\$102.00	\$794,070.00	\$105.00	\$817,425.00	\$100.00	\$778,500.00	\$109.00	\$848,565.00												
5.2	S9.5B	Tons	3,660	\$100.00	\$366,000.00	\$105.00	\$384,300.00	\$100.00	\$366,000.00	\$108.00	\$395,280.00												
			<u> </u>		\$1,160,070.00		\$1,201,725.00		\$1,144,500.00		\$1,243,845.0												
	Concrete City of Concord Standard Valley Type Concrete Curb and Gutter																						
6.1	(Incidental and as directed:	LF	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	ı	NO BID	-	NO BID												
6.2	City of Concord Standard 2'-6" Concrete Curb and Gutter (Incidental and as directed):	LF	0	_	NO BID	_	NO BID	_	NO BID	_	NO BID												
6.3	Wheelchair Ramps (Incidental and as directed:	Ea.	0	_	NO BID	_	NO BID	-	NO BID	_	NO BID												
6.4	4" Thick Concrete Sidewalk	Sq. Yd	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID												
					NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID												
	riping, Remarking. And Replace Pavement Marker	TE	11.057	02.50	Ф20 1 42 50	#2.20	Ф27 140 10	#2.00	Ф22 514 00	Φ2.66	#20.042.62												
7.1	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" Double Yellow Solid Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" Yellow Solid, Skip, and	LF	11,257	\$2.50	\$28,142.50	\$3.30	\$37,148.10	\$2.00	\$22,514.00	\$2.66	\$29,943.62												
7.2	Mini Skip Line	LF	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID												
7.3	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 8" Yellow Gore Line Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" White Solid, Skip, and	LF	81	\$6.50	\$526.50	\$5.50	\$445.50	\$4.00	\$324.00	\$7.06	\$571.86												
7.4	Mini Skip and Parking Stall Line	LF	462	\$2.25	\$1,039.50	\$2.20	\$1,016.40	\$2.00	\$924.00	\$2.44	\$1,127.28												
7.5	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines STOP Bar - 24"	LF	38	\$14.25	\$541.50	\$22.00	\$836.00	\$16.00	\$608.00	\$15.48	\$588.24												
7.6	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk - 8" White NCDOT Std.	LF	0	_	NO BID	_	NO BID	-	NO BID	_	NO BID												
	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk, Hi-Visibility -			01105		422.00		<b>01=00</b>		04.5.40													
7.7 7.8	24" White Bars NCDOT Std.  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Yield Lane Symbol	LF LF	191	\$14.25	\$2,721.75 NO BID	\$22.00	\$4,202.00 NO BID	\$17.00	\$3,247.00 NO BID	\$15.48	\$2,956.68 NO BID												
	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Thur, Right-Turn or Left-	LI.	U	-	NOBID	-				-	NOBID												
7.9	Turn Arrow Thermoplastic Pavment Marking Symbol Combo Arrow - Thur-Rt. /	Ea.	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID		NO BID												
7.10	Thru-Lf. / Thru Rt. & Lf.	Ea.							NO DID	-													
		Lu.	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	<u>-</u> -	NO BID												
/11	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Characters 8'-4" NCDOT								NO BID														
7.11	Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Characters 8'-4" NCDOT Std.  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band	Ea.	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	- - -	NO BID												
7.12	Std.  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std.	Ea.	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID  NO BID	-	NO BID												
	Std.  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std.  Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT	Ea.	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID		NO BID												
7.12	Std.  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std.  Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std.	Ea.	0	-	NO BID	-	NO BID	-	NO BID  NO BID	-	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT	Ea. Ea. Ea.	0 0 0		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID	-	NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea.	0 0 0 0		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID	- - -	NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std.	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID		NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID		NO BID	- - - -	NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea.	0 0 0 0	-	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	- - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea.	0 0 0 0 0		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	- - - - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations	Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0	-	NO BID		NO BID	-	NO BID	- - - - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea.	0 0 0 0 0		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	- - - - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal	Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0		NO BID		NO BID	- - - - - -	NO BID	- - - - - - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops	Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0		NO BID		NO BID	- - - - - -	NO BID	- - - - - - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Existing) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering	Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	-	NO BID  S32,971.75		NO BID S43,648.00		NO BID  S27,617.00	- - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops	Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0		NO BID		NO BID	- - - - - -	NO BID	- - - - - - -	NO BID												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant	Ea.	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	-	NO BID  S32,971.75		NO BID S43,648.00		NO BID  S27,617.00	- - - - - - - -	NO BID S35,187.68												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0		NO BID  S32,971.75		NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00		NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00  \$60,000.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21 A7.1	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5,000	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S32,971.75  \$58,300.00  \$58,300.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00  \$91,850.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00  \$10,500.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$88,250.00												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std.  Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course S9.5B	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0		NO BID  S32,971.75		NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00		NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00  \$60,000.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$68,850.00  \$7,500.00												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21 A7.1	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std.  Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course S9.5B	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5,000	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S32,971.75  \$58,300.00  \$58,300.00  \$12,527.25  \$12,164.40  \$24,691.65	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00  \$91,850.00  \$14,175.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00  \$10,500.00  \$9,000.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$68,850.00  \$7,500.00  \$15,750.00												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21 A7.1 A8.1 A8.2	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course S9.5B Asphalt Leveling - Place and Compact Intermediate Course I19-B	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5,000	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S32,971.75  \$58,300.00  \$12,527.25 \$12,164.40 \$24,691.65	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00  \$91,850.00  \$14,175.00  \$2,988,521.75	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00 \$9,000.00 \$10,500.00 \$9,000.00 \$19,500.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$68,850.00  \$7,500.00  \$15,750.00  \$3,078,167.1												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21 A7.1 A8.1 A8.2	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course S9.5B Asphalt Leveling - Place and Compact Intermediate Course I19-B	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5,000	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S32,971.75  \$58,300.00  \$58,300.00  \$12,527.25  \$12,164.40  \$24,691.65	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00  \$91,850.00  \$14,175.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00 \$9,000.00 \$19,500.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$68,850.00  \$7,500.00  \$15,750.00  \$3,078,167.1												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21 A7.1 A8.1 A8.2 BASE BI + 10% C	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25" of Surface Course S9.5B Asphalt Leveling - Place and Compact Intermediate Course I19-B	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5,000	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S32,971.75  \$58,300.00  \$12,527.25 \$12,164.40 \$24,691.65	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00  \$91,850.00  \$14,175.00  \$2,988,521.75	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00 \$9,000.00 \$10,500.00 \$9,000.00 \$19,500.00	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$88,250.00  \$7,500.00												
7.12 7.13 7.14 7.15 7.16 7.17 7.18 7.19 7.20 7.21  A7.1  A8.1  A8.2  BASE BI + 10% C	Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10' w/ 24" Band NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT Std. Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std.  Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol NCDOT Std. Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant Locations Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal (Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering  Alt. Signal Detection Loops Install Various Size Traffic Signal Embedded Roadway Loops (Includes Saw Cut, Loop Wire, & Sealant  Alt. Resurfacing Bid Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and Compact 1.25" of Surface Course S9.5B Asphalt Leveling - Place and Compact Intermediate Course I19-B  ID SECTIONS SUBTOTAL ONTINGENCY	Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. Ea. LF	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 5,000	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  \$32,971.75  \$58,300.00  \$58,300.00  \$12,527.25  \$12,164.40  \$24,691.65	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S43,648.00  \$91,850.00  \$91,850.00  \$14,175.00  \$2,988,521.75 \$298,852.18	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S27,617.00  \$60,000.00  \$10,500.00  \$10,500.00  \$19,500.00  \$3,016,119.50  \$301,611.95	- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -	NO BID  S35,187.68  \$68,850.00  \$88,250.00  \$7,500.00  \$15,750.00  \$3,078,167.1  \$307,816.7												

This is to certify that bids tabulated herein were publicly opened and read aloud at 2:00 p.m. on April 18, 2022, in the conference room at the Brown Operations Center at 635 Alfred Brown Jr. Ct. SW, Concord, North Carolina.